

**CITY OF MCMECHEN
MARSHALL COUNTY, WEST VIRGINIA
CONTRACT #3 – WATER STORAGE TANK UPGRADES
BID TABULATION
WEDNESDAY, MAY 6, 2020 AT 2:00 PM
Thrasher Project #101-010-0910**

Item	Qty.	Unit	Description	Mid Atlantic Storage Systems, Inc. Washington Court House, OH WV #000252	
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
BASE BID					
1	1	LS	Mobilization/Demobilization	\$ 55,400.00	\$ 55,400.00
2	1	LS	Erosion and Sediment Control	\$ 9,700.00	\$ 9,700.00
3A	1	LS	Removal and replacement of 300,000 Gallon East Water Storage Tank with a 294,000 Gallon (Glass Lined Bolted Steel Tank)	\$ 424,500.00	\$ 424,500.00
3B	1	LS	Removal and replacement of 300,000 Gallon East Water Storage Tank with a 294,000 Gallon (Welded Steel Tank)	No Bid	No Bid
3C	1	LS	Removal and replacement of 300,000 Gallon East Water Storage Tank with a 294,000 Gallon (Epoxy Coated Bolted Steel Tank)	No Bid	No Bid
4	1	LS	Rehabilitation of 300,000 Gallon West Water Storage Tank	\$ 179,600.00	\$ 179,600.00
5	1	LS	Upgrades to existing Valve Vault and Yard Piping	\$ 108,800.00	\$ 108,800.00
6	100	EA	1" Diameter Weld Pit Fillings	\$ 26.00	\$ 2,600.00
7	270	LF	6'-0" High Cyclone Fencing	\$ 58.00	\$ 15,660.00
8	2	EA	10' Wide Swing Gates	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 2,820.00
9	1	LS	Reclamation of Disturbed Areas	\$ 65,400.00	\$ 65,400.00
TOTAL BASE BID				\$	864,480.00

ALTERNATE BID #1					
Item	Qty.	Unit	Description	Mid Atlantic Storage Systems, Inc. Washington Court House, OH WV #000252	
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL COST
1	1	LS	Mobilization/Demobilization	\$ 58,100.00	\$ 58,100.00
2	1	LS	Erosion and Sediment Control	\$ 9,700.00	\$ 9,700.00
3A	1	LS	Removal and replacement of the 300,000 Gallon East and West Water Storage Tanks with (2) 294,000 Gallon (Glass Lined Bolted Steel Tanks)	\$ 737,400.00	\$ 737,400.00
3B	1	LS	Removal and replacement of the 300,000 Gallon East and West Water Storage Tanks with (2) 294,000 Gallon (Welded Steel Tanks)	No Bid	No Bid
3C	1	LS	Removal and replacement of the 300,000 Gallon East and West Water Storage Tanks with (2) 294,000 Gallon (Epoxy Coated Bolted Steel Tanks)	No Bid	No Bid
4	1	LS	Upgrades to existing Valve Vault and Yard Piping	\$ 108,800.00	\$ 108,800.00
5	270	LF	6'-0" High Cyclone Fencing	\$ 58.00	\$ 15,660.00
6	2	EA	10'-00" Wide Swing Gates	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 2,820.00
7	1	LS	Reclamation of Disturbed Areas	\$ 65,400.00	\$ 65,400.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1				\$	997,880.00

THRASHER
600 White Oaks Blvd.
P.O. Box 940
Bridgeport, WV 26330
(304) 624-4108
Fax: 624-7831
thrasher@thethrashergroup.com
www.thethrashergroup.com

DANIEL E. FERRELL
REGISTERED
13462
WEST VIRGINIA
PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER

[Signature]
5/11/2020